
The Marlowes, St Johns Wood, London NW8
Weekly Rental Of £2,500

Welcome to this stunning 4-bedroom, 3-bathroom house that
epitomizes modern comfort and elegance. Nestled in a
tranquil neighbourhood of St John's Wood, this well-
maintained residence works for both relaxation and
entertainment. As you step inside, you'll be greeted by an
abundance of natural light that flows through the carefully
designed layout. The living areas are adorned with tasteful
finishes and offer a seamless connection to the lush garden,
creating an inviting indoor-outdoor living experience. The
kitchen is equipped with top-of-the-line appliances and a
stylish breakfast bar, making meal preparation a delight. The
four bedrooms are generously sized and provide ample
closet space, ensuring everyone has their own private
retreat. One of the standout features of this property is the
convenient driveway capable of accommodating two cars.
This house not only presents a cool and modern specification
but also promises a lifestyle of comfort and sophistication.
Don't miss the opportunity to make this exquisite property
your forever home.

House
Modern Specification
4 Bedrooms
2 Living Rooms
Off Street Parking
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